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Saturday, June 1, 2024

Hydro One - Planned Power Outage

Date and Time: Saturday, June 1 7:00 am - 11:00 am

Address: Bayham

Hydro One has scheduled a Planned Outage for Bayham and area residents.

Please see the website for the outage map and more information.

https://d8bkcndcv6jca.cloudfront.net/?c=PlannedOutagesExternal&o=PlannedOutagesExt

Edisonfest

Date and Time: Saturday, June 1 9:00 am - 5:00 pm

Address: 6226 Plank Rd, Vienna

The Bayham Historical Society is hosting their annual Edisonfest at the Vienna Memorial Park on Saturday, Jun
e 1st from 9am - 5pm

Admission is free, however donations are greatly appreciated!

There will be vendors, face painting, sack races, bouncy castles, craft activities, 50/50 draw, spaghetti eating co
ntest, lucky draws, science guy, aboriginal dancers and much more!

Watch for updates on their facebook page https://www.facebook.com/BayhamHistoricalSociety/ or you can em
ail them at bayhamhistoricalsociety@hotmail.com

Bring the whole family out for a funfilled day at the Vienna Park! 

NO POWER - NO PROBLEM! The scheduled planned outage from Hydro One is no match for the great vol
unteers and members for making sure the day goes on without a hitch! 

 

BHS - Ribbon Cutting Ceremony

Date and Time: Saturday, June 1 9:30 am

Address: 6209 Plank Rd, Vienna

The Bayham Historical Society is thrilled to invite you to their Ribbon Cutting ceremony for the 2024 Opening
Season of the Edison, Vienna & Area Museum located at 6209 Plank Rd, Vienna, on June 1st at 9:30am 

https://d8bkcndcv6jca.cloudfront.net/?c=PlannedOutagesExternal&o=PlannedOutagesExt
https://www.facebook.com/BayhamHistoricalSociety/
http://events.bayham.on.ca/default/bayhamhistoricalsociety@hotmail.com


There will be Honourary Members and Dignitaries to support the event! All are welcome!

Their annual Edisonfest in the Vienna Memorial Park will follow right after.

Check out their Facebook page for more exciting news and events!

https://www.facebook.com/BayhamHistoricalSociety/

Thursday, June 6, 2024

Regular Council Meeting

Date and Time: Thursday, June 6 7:00 pm

Address: 56169 Heritage Line, Straffordville - Council Chambers (lower level)

Open to the public

Agenda posted the Friday before the meeting

Public Agenda items due 9am the Tuesday prior to the final posted Agenda

Livestream available on Bayham's YouTube Channel

Saturday, June 8, 2024

LemonAID Day

Date and Time: Saturday, June 8 9:00 am - 5:00 pm

Address: Countywide

LemonAID Day is a county-wide initiative spearheaded by a partnership between Doug Tarry Homes and the El
gin Children's Foundation.  This initiative aims to transform neighborhoods across Elgin County into vibrant le
monade stands. These stands will not only provide refreshing drinks but also raise funds to support a worthy ca
use: sending deserving children to camp connected with Family and Children's Sevices of St. Thoams and Elgin.

Camp provides a safe and enriching environment where children can learn new skills, build friendships, and cre
ate lasting memories. Funds raised through LemonAID Day will directly benefit these children, allowing them t
o experience the joy and transformative power of camp.

For more information, reach out to Myles Proulx at the Elgin Children's Foundation 519-619-5952.

 

Flag Raising Ceremony for Blue Flag Beach Status

Date and Time: Saturday, June 8 1:00 pm

https://www.facebook.com/BayhamHistoricalSociety/
https://www.youtube.com/@municipalityofbayham6931/streams


Address: 1 Robinson St, Port Burwell

The Port Burwell Municipal Beach has been once again deemed a Blue Flag Beach for 2024!

Join us for a Flag Raising Ceremony on Saturday, June 8, 2024 at 1:00pm.

https://www.swimdrinkfish.ca/blog/blue-flags-awarded-2024

Grand Reopening Port Burwell Marine Museum

Date and Time: Saturday, June 8 2:00 pm - 4:00 pm

Address: 20 Pitt Street, Port Burwell

Join us for the ribbon cutting and light refreshments from 2:00 p.m. to 4:00 p.m. at the Port Burwell Marine M
useum.  Exciting new exhibits and changes for the 2024 Season - Meet and greet community members and take 
a look at the new exhibits in the Museum.  

Wednesday, June 12, 2024

BINGO

Date and Time: Wednesday, June 12 5:30 pm

Address: 56169 Heritage Line, Straffordville

Straffordville Community Committee is hosting their regular Bingo games at the Straffordville Community Ce
ntre located at 56169 Heritage Line, Straffordville.

Bingo game starts at 7 pm (Doors open at 5:30 pm)

$13 for a 9 up book of cards + Nevada Balls are back!!

All proceeds go to Watermelonfest! Please see poster for more information.

Saturday, June 15, 2024

Ontario Free Family Fishing Weekend

Date and Time: Saturday, June 15 12:00 am

Address: Ontario

Canadians can fish for free without a licence in Ontario 4 times a year:

Family Fishing Weekend (February 17-19, 2024) 

Mother's Day Weekend (May 11-12, 2024)

https://www.swimdrinkfish.ca/blog/blue-flags-awarded-2024
https://www.google.com/maps/place/56169+Heritage+Line,+Straffordville,+ON+N0J+1Y0/@42.7485386,-80.7836344,835m/data=!3m2!1e3!4b1!4m6!3m5!1s0x882dd5b93e2af6f3:0xa3c2832b03a8b99a!8m2!3d42.7485347!4d-80.7810595!16s%2Fg%2F11c169bp1g?hl=en&entry=ttu


Father's Day Weekend (June 15-16, 2024)

Family Fishing Week (June 29 - July 7, 2024)

Please visit the Ontario Free Family Fishing website for all the information.

Sunday, June 16, 2024

Ontario Free Family Fishing Weekend

Date and Time: Sunday, June 16 12:00 am

Address: Ontario

Canadians can fish for free without a licence in Ontario 4 times a year:

Family Fishing Weekend (February 17-19, 2024) 

Mother's Day Weekend (May 11-12, 2024)

Father's Day Weekend (June 15-16, 2024)

Family Fishing Week (June 29 - July 7, 2024)

Please visit the Ontario Free Family Fishing website for all the information.

Masonic Breakfast

Date and Time: Sunday, June 16 8:00 am - 1:00 pm

Address: 17 Edison Drive, Vienna

Vienna Lodge monthly family breakfast will be held Sunday, June 16, 2024 from 8am - 1pm at the Vienna Mas
onic Lodge (17 Edison Drive, Vienna).

Come one...come all, for fresh homemade biscuits and eggs any style!

 

Wednesday, June 19, 2024

EarlyON East Playgroup in the Park - Straffordville Pavilion

Date and Time: Wednesday, June 19 9:30 am - 11:30 am

Address: 56169 Heritage Line, Straffordville ON N0J 1Y0

Join East Elgin EarlyON Child and Family Centre as we Play & Learn in the Park.  Every Wednesday morning S

https://www.ontario.ca/page/free-family-fishing#section-0
https://www.ontario.ca/page/free-family-fishing#section-0


tarting June 19.  9:30-11:30 am at the Straffordville Community Centre Pavilion.  For families/caregivers with
children 0-6 years.  Come play and learn with your children. Toys, Crafts, playdough, bubbles, and lots of activi
ties.  No registration is required, just drop in.  For more information email c.zwicker@communitylivingelgin.c
om.

Official Plan Review 2024 - Open House

Date and Time: Wednesday, June 19 6:00 pm - 8:00 pm

Address: 56169 Heritage Line

An in-person Open House is being held Wednesday, June 19, 2024 from 6:00 pm to 8:00 pm at the Straffordvil
le Communtiy Centre - Main Hall to provide an opportunity for the public to hear a presentation and discuss th
e key themes and changes being considered as part of the Official Plan Review 2024.  See the NOTICE for mor
e details.

Thursday, June 20, 2024

EarlyON East Playgroup in the Park - Port Burwell

Date and Time: Thursday, June 20 9:30 am - 11:30 am

Address: 21 Pitt St, Port Burwell ON N0J 1T0

East Elgin EarlyON Child and Family Centre - Playgroup in the Park.  Join us Outside every Thursday morning
from 9:30-11:30 at the Port Burwell Pavilion beside the Fred Bodsworth Library.  This program is for families
/caregivers with children 0-6 years.  We will have toys, crafts, and activities and end our program with a story a
nd songs.  This is a drop-in program, so come when you are able. Weather Permitting.

Regular Council Meeting

Date and Time: Thursday, June 20 7:00 pm

Address: 56169 Heritage Line, Straffordville - Council Chambers (lower level)

Open to the public

Agenda posted the Friday before the meeting

Public Agenda items due 9am the Tuesday prior to the final posted Agenda

Livestream available on Bayham's YouTube Channel

Saturday, June 22, 2024

SHF Annual Golf Tournament

http://events.bayham.on.ca/FileManager/Municipality%20of%20Bayham/17779c3c-acc8-4bb4-a96c-b17301333343/Content/1%20Notice%20Phase-Two_Open-House-Notification.pdf
https://www.youtube.com/@municipalityofbayham6931/streams


Date and Time: Saturday, June 22 10:00 am

Address: 9632 Culloden Rd, Eden

Join us for our Annual Golf Tournament Fundraiser.  4 person scramble.  18 holes.  Registration at 9:00am.  Sh
otgun start at 10:00am.  $60/person. Limited spaces available.

Wednesday, June 26, 2024

EarlyON East Playgroup in the Park - Straffordville Pavilion

Date and Time: Wednesday, June 26 9:30 am - 11:30 am

Address: 56169 Heritage Line, Straffordville ON N0J 1Y0

Join East Elgin EarlyON Child and Family Centre as we Play & Learn in the Park.  Every Wednesday morning S
tarting June 19.  9:30-11:30 am at the Straffordville Community Centre Pavilion.  For families/caregivers with
children 0-6 years.  Come play and learn with your children. Toys, Crafts, playdough, bubbles, and lots of activi
ties.  No registration is required, just drop in.  For more information email c.zwicker@communitylivingelgin.c
om.

BINGO

Date and Time: Wednesday, June 26 5:30 pm

Address: 56169 Heritage Line, Straffordville

Straffordville Community Committee is hosting their regular Bingo games at the Straffordville Community Ce
ntre located at 56169 Heritage Line, Straffordville.

Bingo game starts at 7 pm (Doors open at 5:30 pm)

$13 for a 9 up book of cards + Nevada Balls are back!!

All proceeds go to Watermelonfest! Please see poster for more information.

Thursday, June 27, 2024

EarlyON East Playgroup in the Park - Port Burwell

Date and Time: Thursday, June 27 9:30 am - 11:30 am

Address: 21 Pitt St, Port Burwell ON N0J 1T0

East Elgin EarlyON Child and Family Centre - Playgroup in the Park.  Join us Outside every Thursday morning
from 9:30-11:30 at the Port Burwell Pavilion beside the Fred Bodsworth Library.  This program is for families
/caregivers with children 0-6 years.  We will have toys, crafts, and activities and end our program with a story a
nd songs.  This is a drop-in program, so come when you are able. Weather Permitting.

https://www.google.com/maps/place/56169+Heritage+Line,+Straffordville,+ON+N0J+1Y0/@42.7485386,-80.7836344,835m/data=!3m2!1e3!4b1!4m6!3m5!1s0x882dd5b93e2af6f3:0xa3c2832b03a8b99a!8m2!3d42.7485347!4d-80.7810595!16s%2Fg%2F11c169bp1g?hl=en&entry=ttu


http://events.bayham.on.ca

Saturday, June 29, 2024

Ontario Free Family Fishing Weekend

Date and Time: Saturday, June 29 12:05 am

Address: Ontario

Canadians can fish for free without a licence in Ontario 4 times a year:

Family Fishing weekend (February 17-19, 2024)

Mother's Day Weekend (May 11-12, 2024)

Father's Day Weekend (June 15-16, 2024)

Family Fishing Week (June 29 - July 7, 2024)

Please visit the Ontario Free Family Fishing website for all the information.

Sunday, June 30, 2024

Ontario Free Family Fishing Weekend

Date and Time: Sunday, June 30 12:05 am

Address: Ontario

Canadians can fish for free without a licence in Ontario 4 times a year:

Family Fishing weekend (February 17-19, 2024)

Mother's Day Weekend (May 11-12, 2024)

Father's Day Weekend (June 15-16, 2024)

Family Fishing Week (June 29 - July 7, 2024)

Please visit the Ontario Free Family Fishing website for all the information.

https://www.ontario.ca/page/free-family-fishing#section-0
https://www.ontario.ca/page/free-family-fishing#section-0
http://events.bayham.on.ca

